
 

2943 GI/2016 (1) 

 

jftLVªh laö Mhö ,yö&33004@99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

vlk/kj.k 
EXTRAORDINARY 

Hkkx III—[k.M 4 
PART III—Section 4 

izkf/dkj ls izdkf'kr 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

la-  247] ubZ fnYyh] c`gLifrokj] twu 9] 2016@T;s"B 19] 1938   
No. 247] NEW DELHI,  THURSDAY,  JUNE  9,  2016/ JYAISTHA 19 , 1938 

Hkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.kHkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.kHkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.kHkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.k    

vf/klwpuk 

ubZ fnYyh] 8 twu] 2016 

Hkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.k ¼vf/kdkfj;ksa vkSj deZpkfj;ksa dh fu;qfDr½ fofu;e] 2016Hkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.k ¼vf/kdkfj;ksa vkSj deZpkfj;ksa dh fu;qfDr½ fofu;e] 2016Hkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.k ¼vf/kdkfj;ksa vkSj deZpkfj;ksa dh fu;qfDr½ fofu;e] 2016Hkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.k ¼vf/kdkfj;ksa vkSj deZpkfj;ksa dh fu;qfDr½ fofu;e] 2016    

¼2016 dk 04½¼2016 dk 04½¼2016 dk 04½¼2016 dk 04½ 

lalalala----    5&1@2014&i5&1@2014&i5&1@2014&i5&1@2014&i----z ,oa dkz ,oa dkz ,oa dkz ,oa dk----&&&&&&&&Hkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.k vf/kfu;e] 1997 ¼1997 dk 24½ dh /kkjk 10 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ rFkk 
/kkjk 36 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ }kjk iznÙk 'kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs gq,] Hkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.k] Hkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked 
izkf/kdj.k¼vf/kdkfj;ksa vkSj deZpkfj;ksa dh fu;qfDr½ fofu;e] 2001 ¼2001 dk 2½ esa vkSj la'kks/ku djus ds fy, ,rn~}kjk fuEufyf[kr fofu;e cukrk 
gS] vFkkZr~ %& 

1- ¼1½  bl fofu;e dks Hkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.k¼vf/kdkfj;ksa rFkk deZpkfj;ksa dh fu;qfDr½ ¼X;kjgoka la'kks/ku½ fofu;e] 2016 dgk 
tk,xkA    

¼2½  ;g fofu;e] blds ljdkjh jkti= esa izdk’ku dh frfFk ls ykxw gksxkA 

2- Hkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.k ¼vf/kdkfj;ksa rFkk deZpkfj;ksa dh fu;qfDr½ fofu;e] 2001 ¼ftUgsa blds i’pkr~ ewy fofu;e dgk tk,xk½ 
ds fofu;e 3 ds mi&fofu;e ¼iii½ esa rkfydk&d esa **xzsM@in** dkWye ds rgr vf/kdkfj;ksa ds laoxZ ds rgr **rduhdh vf/kdkjh** izfof”V ds 
i’pkr~ **rduhdh vf/kdkjh ¼vfHk;kaf=dh½** dks var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xkA  

3- ewy fofu;e ds fofu;e 5 esa]----- 

¼d½ mi&fofu;e ¼i½ esa] rkfydk esa]---- 

¼i½ **HkrhZ dk rjhdk** dkWye esa la;qDr lykgdkj ds in ds le{k **izfrfu;qfDr@vkesyu@lh/kh HkrhZ** izfof”V ds LFkku ij 
**izksUufr@izfrfu;qfDr@vkesyu@lh/kh HkrhZ** dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼ii½ **in dk uke** dkWye ds rgr **rduhdh vf/kdkjh** izfof”V ds i’pkr~ **rduhdh vf/kdkjh ¼vfHk;kaf=dh½** izfof”V dks var%LFkkfir fd;k 
tk,xk rFkk ,sls var%LFkkfir **rduhdh vf/kdkjh ¼vfHk;kaf=dh½** in ds le{k] ----- 

¼d½ **HkrhZ dk rjhdk** dkWye ds rgr **izfrfu;qfDr@vkesyu@lh/kh HkrhZ**] izfof”V( vkSj 

¼[k½ **;ksX;rk@vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr **vuqlwph&I ds ;Fkkuqlkj** izfof”V dks var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼[k½ mi&fofu;e ¼iii½ ds i’pkr~] fuEu Li”Vhdj.k dks var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] uker%& 

**Li”Vhdj.k **Li”Vhdj.k **Li”Vhdj.k **Li”Vhdj.k % lansg nwj djus ds fy,] ;g Li”V fd;k tkrk gS fd lfpo] iz/kku lykgdkj] lykgdkj vkSj la;qDr lykgdkj ds in ij p;u 
gsrq fu;qfDr gksus ij vf/kdkfj;ksa }kjk Hkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.k ds laoxZ esa lfEefyr fd, tkus ds i’pkr~ Hkkjrh; nwjlapkj 



2       THE   GAZETTE   OF  INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY              [PART III—SEC. 4] 

 

 

fofu;ked izkf/kdj.k esa iznku dh xbZ lsok dks lsokfuof̀Ùk ykHk iznku djus ds fy, fopkj fd;k tk,xk rFkk mDr inksa ij lh/kh HkrhZ vkSj 
izfrfu;qfDr ds ek/;e ls muds p;u gsrq fofufnZ”V vk;q lhek Hkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.k laoxZ ds vf/kdkfj;ksa ij ykxw ugha gksxhA** 

4- ewy fofu;e ds fofu;e 10d esa mi&fofu;e ¼1½ ds LFkku ij] fuEu mi&fofu;e dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] uker% %& 

**¼1½ fu;qfDr izkf/kdkjh] le;&le; ij] mi;qZDr vkns’k ds ek/;e ls LFkk;h vkesyu vk/kkj ij vf/kdkfj;ksa ds laoxZ ls fdlh O;fDr dh fu;qfDr 
dj ldrk gS% 

Ck’krsZa fdlh Hkh O;fDr dks LFkk;h vkesyu vk/kkj fu;qDr ugha fd;k tk,xk] tc rd fd ,sls O;fDr us]-- 

¼d½ izkf/kdj.k }kjk ,slk djus ds fy, dgs tkus ij izkf/kdj.k esa LFkk;h :i ls vkesfyr gksus ds fy, fyf[kr esa viuk fodYi u fn;k gks( vkSj 

¼[k½ izkf/kdj.k esa ,d o”kZ dh izfrfu;qfDr vof/k iw.kZ u dh gks( 

c’krZs vkxs fd izFke ijarqd ds [k.M ¼[k½ esa varfoZ”V dksbZ Hkh ‘krZ ofj”B vuqla/kku vf/kdkjh xzsM rd dh fu;qfDr ij ykxw ugha gksxhA** 

5- ewy fofu;e ds fofu;e 14] ds mi&fofu;e ¼iii½] esa ----- 

¼d½ **bl fofu;e ds ykxw gksus ij** ‘kCnksa dk yksi fd;k tk,xk( 

¼[k½ rkfydk&[k esa **xzsM@in** dkWye ds rgr deZpkjh laoxZ esa **Mªkboj¼xzsM&I½] Mªkboj¼xzsM&II½** izfof”V ds LFkku ij **Mªkboj¼fo’ks”k xzsM½] 
Mªkboj ¼xzsM&I½ Mªkboj ¼xzsM&II½] Mªkboj ¼lk/kkj.k xzsM½** dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

6- ewy fofu;e ds fofu;e 16] esa ----- 

¼d½ mi&fofu;e ¼i½ esa] rkfydk esa] **in dk uke** dkWye ds rgr **voj Js.kh fyfid** izfof”V ds i’pkr~ **Mªkboj¼fo’ks”k xzsM½** dks var%LFkkfir 
fd;k tk,xk rFkk **Mªkboj¼fo’ks”k xzsM½** in ds le{k fuEu var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk]---- 

¼i½ **HkrhZ dk rjhdk** dkWye ds rgr] **izksUufr** izfof”V] rFkk 

¼ii½ **;ksX;rk@vUkqHko** izfof”V ds rgr **vuqlwph-II ds ;Fkkuqlkj**--- izfof”V dks var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼[k½ **HkrhZ dk rjhdk** dkWye esa Mªkboj ¼xzsM&I½ in ds le{k **izksUufr@izfrfu;qfDr@vkesyu** izfof”V ds LFkku ij **izksUufr** izfof”V dks 
izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼x½ **HkrhZ dk rjhdk** dkWye esa **Mªkboj ¼xzsM&II½** in ds le{k **izksUufr@izfrfu;qfDr@vkesyu@ lh/kh HkrhZ** izfof”V ds LFkku ij **izksUufr** 
izfof”V dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼?k½ **in dk uke** dkWye ds rgr **Mªkboj ¼xzsM&II½** izfof”V ds i’pkr~ **Mªkboj ¼lk/kkj.k xzsM½** dks var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk rFkk 
**Mªkboj¼lk/kkj.k xzsM½** in ds le{k fuEu vr%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk]---- 

¼i½ **HkrhZ dk rjhdk** dkWye ds rgr **izksUufr@izfrfu;qfDr@vkesyu@lh/kh HkrhZ** izfof”V( vkSj 

¼ii½ **;ksX;rk@vUkqHko** izfof”V ds rgr **vuqlwph-II ds ;Fkkuqlkj**--- izfof”V dks var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

7- ewy fofu;e ds fofu;e 21d esa] mi&fofu;e¼1½ ds LFkku ij fuEu mi&fofu;e dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] uker%& 

**¼1½ fu;qfDr izkf/kdkjh] le;&le; ij] mi;qZDr vkns’k ds ek/;e ls LFkk;h vkesyu vk/kkj ij deZpkfj;ksa ds laoxZ ls fdlh Hkh O;fDr dh 
fu;qfDr dj ldrk gS% 

c’krZs fd fdlh Hkh O;fDr dks LFkk;h vkesyu vk/kkj ij fu;qDr ugha fd;k tk,xk] tc rd fd ,sls fdlh O;fDr us] LFkk;h vkesyu gsrq 
izkf/kdj.k }kjk iwNs tkus ij] fyf[kr esa izkf/kdj.k esa LFkk;h :i ls vkesfyr gksus dk fodYi u fn;k gksA** 

8- ewy fofu;e dh vuqlwph&I esa] --- 

¼d½ **izfrfu;qfDr gsrq ;ksX;rk rFkk vuqHko** ‘kh”kZd ds rgr iz/kku lykgdkj ds in ds le{k**]  

¼i½  izfof”V ¼ii½ esa] **rhu o”kkZasa dh fu;fer lsok** ‘kCnksa ds LFkku ij **pkj o”kksZa dh fu;fer lsok** ‘kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk% 

¼ii½  izfof”V ¼iii½ esa] **rhu o”kkZasa dh fu;fer lsok** ‘kCnksa ds LFkku ij **pkj o”kksZa dh fu;fer lsok** ‘kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk% 

¼[k½ la;qDr lykgdkj ds in ds le{k] ----- 

¼i½ **HkrhZ dk rjhdk** dkWye ds rgr **izfrfu;qfDr@vkesyu@lh/kh HkrhZ** izfof”V ds LFkku ij fuEu izfof”V dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] 
uker%& 

**¼i½ izksUufr ds ek/;e ls ipkl izfr’kr inksa dks Hkjk tk,xk] ,slk u gksus ij inksa dks izfrfu;qfDr ds ek/;e ls Hkjk tk,xkA 

¼ii½ ipkl izfr’kr inksa dks **izfrfu;qfDr@vkesyu@lh/kh HkrhZ** ds ek/;e ls Hkjk tk,xkA** 

¼ii½ **izksUufr gsrq lsok dh vof/k** dkWye ds rgr **¼i½ ftl in ds fy, p;u fd;k tkuk gS] mlls ,d xzsM uhps ds in ij pkj o”kkZsa dh 
fu;fer lsok iw.kZ djus okys vf/kdkfj;ksa esa ls izksUufr ds ek/;e ls **izfof”V ds LFkku ij** ftl in ds fy, p;u fd;k tkuk gS] mlls ,d xzsM 
uhps ds in ij ikap o”kkZsa dh fu;fer lsok iw.kZ djus okys vf/kdkjh] ftuds ikl vissf{kr ‘kS{kf.kd rFkk rduhdh ;ksX;rk gS] mu vf/kdkfj;ksa esa ls 
izksUufr ds ek/;e ls** ’kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 



¹Hkkx IIIµ[k.M 4º Hkkjr dk jkti=k % vlk/kj.k 3 

 

 

¼iii½ **izfrfu;qfDr gsrq ;ksX;rk vkSj vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr] 

¼d½ izfof”V ¼ii½ esa] **pkj o”kkZasa dh fu;fer lsok** ‘kCnksa ds LFkku ij **ikap o”kksZa dh fu;fer lsok** ‘kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼[k½ izfof”V ¼iii½ esa] **pkj o”kkZasa dh fu;fer lsok** ‘kCnksa ds LFkku ij **ikap o”kksZa dh fu;fer lsok** dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼x½ **in dk uke** dkWye ds rgr **rduhdh vf/kdkjh** izfof”V ds i’pkr~ **rduhdh vf/kdkjh ¼vfHk;kaf=dh½** izfof”V dks var%LFkkfir fd;k 
tk,xk rFkk ,sls var%LFkkfir **rduhdh vf/kdkjh ¼vfHk;kaf=dh½** in ds le{k] -----  

¼i½ **HkrhZ dk rjhdk** dkWye ds rgr **izfrfu;qfDr@vkesyu@lh/kh HkrhZ**] izfof”V(  

¼ii½ **lh/kh HkrhZ gsrq ;ksX;rk rFkk vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr **bysDVªkWfuDl@nwjlapkj@lwpuk izkS|ksfxdh@dEI;wVj foKku fo”k; esa fdlh ekU;rk 
izkIr fo’ofo|ky;@LkaLFkku ls vfHk;kaf=dh eas mikf/k ¼fMxzh½ ds lkFk laxr {ks= esa rhu o”kZ dk vuqHko**(  

¼iii½ **izksUufr gsrq lsok dh vof/k** dkWye ds rgr **ykxw ugha** izfof”V( 

¼iv½ **izfrfu;qfDr gsrq ;ksX;rk vkSj vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr **dsUnz ljdkj] lkoZtfud {ks= ds m|eksa rFkk lkafof/kd vkSj Lok;Ùk fudk;ksa ds 
vf/kdkjh] ftUgsa fdlh ekU;rk izkIr fo’ofo|ky;@LkaLFkku ls bysDVªkWfuDl@nwjlapkj@lwpuk izkS|ksfxdh@dEI;wVj foKku fo”k; esa vfHk;kaf=dh 
fo”k; eas mikf/k izkIr gks vFkok ¼ii½ vuqHkkx vf/kdkjh vFkok led{k xzsM esa rhu o”kksZa dh fu;fer lsok iw.kZ dj pqds gksaA vf/kdkjh dks dEI;wVj 
dk dk;Zlk/kd Kku rFkk laxr {ks= esa vuqHko vo’; gksuk pkfg,**( vkSj 

¼v½ **lh/kh HkrhZ gsrq vk;q** dkWye ds rgr **rhl o”kZ ls vf/kd ugha gks** izfof”V dks var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼?k½ var esa vkus okys fVIi.k 6 ds i’pkr~] fuEu var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] uker% %& 

**fVIi.k 7**fVIi.k 7**fVIi.k 7**fVIi.k 7 &lgk;d] vuqHkkx vf/kdkjh] ofj”B vuqla/kku vf/kdkjh] mi&lykgdkj] la;qDr lykgdkj] lykgdkj] iz/kku lykgdkj vkSj lfpo ds 
in ij izfrfu;qfDr vk/kkj ij fu;qfDr gsrq *rqjar vkesyu* fd, tkus ds fu;e ls NwV visf{kr ugha gSA** 

9- ewy fofu;e dh vuqlwph&II esa] ------ 

¼d½ **izksUufr gsrq lsok dh vof/k** dkWye ds rgr lgk;d ds in ds le{k **dEI;wVj ds dk;Zlk/kd Kku ds lkFk voj Js.kh fyfid ds xzsM esa 
nl o”kkZsa dh fu;fer lsok iw.kZ dj pqds deZpkfj;ksa ds e/; ls izksUufr ds ek/;e ls** izfof”V ds LFkku ij **dEI;wVj ds dk;Zlk/kd Kku j[kus 
okys deZpkfj;ksas a ds e/; ls izksUufr ds ek/;e ls tks ¼i½ voj Js.kh fyfid ds xzsM esa nl o”kkZsa dh fu;fer lsok iw.kZ dj pqds gksa] vFkok ¼ii½ 
QksVksdkWih e’khu vkWijsVj ds xzsM esa nl o”kksZa dh fu;fer lsok ds lkFk ekU;rk izkIr cksMZ vFkok laLFkku ls eSfVªd vFkok led{k ;ksX;rk rFkk 
Hkkjrh; nwjlapkj fofu;ked izkf/kdj.k }kjk vk;ksftr ijh{kk lQyrkiwoZd mÙkh.kZ dh gks** ‘kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼[k½ **izksUufr gsrq lsok dh vof/k** dkWye ds rgr voj Js.kh fyfid ds in ds le{k] --- 

¼i½  izfof”V ¼ii½ esa] **vaxzsth@fgUnh esa 30 ‘kCn izfr feuV dh Vad.k xfr** ‘kCnksa ds i’pkr~ **vFkok dEI;wVj izpkyu esa izoh.krk dk fu/kkZj.k 
ijh{kk ds ek/;e ls fd;k tk,xk** ‘kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼ii½ izfof”V ¼ii½ esa] **fgUnh** ‘kCn ds i’pkr~ vkus okys ‘kCn **rFkk** dk yksi fd;k tk,xk( 

¼iii½  izfof”V ¼iii½ dk yksi fd;k tk,xk( 

¼x½ **in dk uke** dkWye ds rgr **voj Js.kh fyfid** izfof”V ds i’pkr~] **Mªkboj¼fo’ks”k xzsM½** dks var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk rFkk ,sls 
var%LFkkfir **Mªkboj¼fo’ks”k xzsM½** ds in ds le{k] --- 

¼i½ **HkrhZ dk rjhdk** dkWye ds rgr **izksUufr**] izfof”V(  

¼ii½ **lh/kh HkrhZ gsrq ;ksX;rk vkSj vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr **ykxw ugha** izfof”V( 

¼iii½ **izksUufr gsrq lsok dh vof/k@vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr** 2800 #i, xzsM&is ds lkFk is&cSaM&I ¼5200&20200 #i,½ esa Mªkboj ¼xzsM&I½ esa 
rhu o”kZ dh fu;fer lsok iw.kZ dj pqds deZpkfj;ksa ds e/; ls izksUufr ds ek/;e ls** izfof”V( 

¼iv½ **izfrfu;qfDr ds vk/kkj ij ;ksX;rk vkSj vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr **ykxw ugha** izfof”V( vkSj 

¼v½ **lh/kh HkrhZ gsrq vk;q** dkWye ds rgr **ykxw ugha** izfof”V---- 
dks var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼?k½ Mªkboj ¼xzsM&I½ ds in ds le{k] ---- 

¼i½ **HkrhZ dk rjhdk** dkWye ds rgr **izksUufr@izfrfu;qfDr@vkesyu@lh/kh HkrhZ** izfof”V ds LFkku ij **izksUufr** izfof”V(  

¼ii½ **lh/kh HkrhZ gsrq ;ksX;rk vkSj vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr** **ykxw ugha** izfof”V( 

¼iii½ **izksUufr gsrq lsok dh vof/k@vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr **2400 #i, xzsM&is ds lkFk is&cSaM&I ¼5200&20200 #i,½ esa Mªkboj ¼xzsM&II½ esa 
Ng o”kZ dh fu;fer lsok vFkok Mªkboj xzsM&II rFkk Mªkboj ¼lk/kkj.k xzsM½ esa dqy ianzg o”kZ dh lsok iw.kZ dj pqds deZpkjh] ftUgksaus ljdkj }kjk 
fofufnZ”V VªsM VsLV mÙkh.kZ fd;k gks] dh izksUufr ds ek/;e ls** izfof”V( 

¼iv½ **izfrfu;qfDr gsrq ;ksX;rk vkSj vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr **ykxw ugha** izfof”V( vkSj 

¼v½ **lh/kh HkrhZ gsrq vk;q** dkWye ds rgr **ykxw ugha** izfof”V]  dks var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 



4       THE   GAZETTE   OF  INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY              [PART III—SEC. 4] 

 

 

¼³½ Mªkboj¼xzsM&II½ ds in ds le{k] ---- 

¼i½ **HkrhZ dk rjhdk** dkWye ds rgr **izksUufr@izfrfu;qfDr@vkesyu@lh/kh HkrhZ** izfof”V ds LFkku ij **izksUufr** izfof”V( 

¼ii½ **lh/kh HkrhZ gsrq ;ksX;rk vkSj vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr** **ykxw ugha** izfof”V( 

¼iii½ **izksUufr gsrq lsok dh vof/k@vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr **1900 #i, xzsM&is ds lkFk is&cSaM&I ¼5200&20200 #i,½ esa Mªkboj¼lk/kkj.k xzsM½ 
esa ukS o”kZ dh fu;fer lsok iw.kZ dj pqds deZpkfj;ksa ds e/; ls izksUufr ds ek/;e ls** izfof”V( 

¼iv½ **izfrfu;qfDr gsrq ;ksX;rk vkSj vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr **ykxw ugha** izfof”V( vkSj 

¼v½ **lh/kh HkrhZ gsrq vk;q** dkWye ds rgr **ykxw ugha** izfof”V]  dks var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼p½ **in dk uke** dkWye ds rgr **Mªkboj¼xzsM&II½** izfof”V ds i’pkr~ **Mªkboj¼lk/kkj.k xzsM½** dks var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk rFkk ,sls 
var%LFkkfir **Mªkboj¼lk/kkj.k xzsM½** ds in ds le{k]--- 

¼i½ **HkrhZ dk rjhdk** dkWye ds rgr **izksUufr@izfrfu;qfDr@vkesyu@lh/kh HkrhZ** izfof”V( 

¼ii½ **lh/kh HkrhZ gsrq ;ksX;rk vkSj vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr **p¼i½ vkBoha d{kk mÙkh.kZ] ¼ii½ eksVj dkj pykus dk oS/k MªkbZfoax ykblsal gksuk 
pkfg,] ¼iii½ eksVj&okgu iz.kkyh dk Kku¼okgu esa NksVh&eksVh [kkfe;kas dks nwj djus esa l{ke gks½ vkSj ¼iv½ rhu o”kZ eksVj dkj pykus dk vuqHko 
gks**] izfof”V( 

¼iii½ **izksUufr gsrq lsok dh vof/k@vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr **¼i½ vkBoha d{kk mÙkh.kZ] ¼ii½ eksVj dkj pykus dk oS/k MªkbZfoax ykblsal gksuk 
pkfg,] ¼iii½ eksVj&okgu iz.kkyh dk Kku¼okgu esa NksVh&eksVh [kkfe;kas dks nwj djus esa l{ke gks½ vkSj ¼iv½ rhu o”kZ eksVj dkj pykus dk vuqHko 
gks**] izfof”V( 

¼iv½ **izfrfu;qfDr vk/kkj ij LFkkukarj.k gsrq ;ksX;rk vkSj vuqHko** dkWye ds rgr **dsUnz ljdkj] lkoZtfud {ks= ds m|eksa rFkk lkafof/kd vkSj 
Lok;Ùk fudk;ksa ds deZpkjh] ftUgksaus led{k in /kkj.k fd;k gks vFkok lewg ?k ds deZpkjh] ftUgsa fuEu ;ksX;rk izkIr gks& 

**¼i½ vkBoha d{kk mÙkh.kZ] ¼ii½ eksVj dkj pykus dk oS/k MªkbZfoax ykblsal gksuk pkfg,] ¼iii½ eksVj&okgu iz.kkyh dk Kku¼okgu esa NksVh&eksVh 
[kkfe;kas dks nwj djus esa l{ke gks½ vkSj ¼iv½ rhu o”kZ eksVj dkj pykus dk vuqHko gks**] vkSj 

¼v½ **lh/kh HkrhZ gsrq vk;q** dkWye ds rgr **pkyhl o”kZ ls vf/kd u gks** izfof”V] dks var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

10-  ewy fofu;e  dh **vuqlwph&III** esa] **in dk uke** dkWye ds rgr] ---- 

¼d½ **rduhdh vf/kdkjh** izfof”V ds LFkku ij **rduhdh vf/kdkjh RkFkk rduhdh vf/kdkjh ¼vfHk;kaf=dh½** izfof”V dks var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼[k½ **Mªkboj¼xzsM&I½** vkSj **Mªkboj¼xzsM&II½** izfof”V ds LFkku ij **Mªkboj ¼fo’ks”k xzsM½] Mªkboj¼xzsM&I½] Mªkboj¼xzsM*II½ rFkk Mªkboj¼lk/kkj.k 
xzsM½** izfof”V dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xkA 

lh- ih- ,l- cD’kh] lykgdkj ¼iz’kklu½ 

[foKkiu.-III/4/vlk./128/16] 

fVIi.khfVIi.khfVIi.khfVIi.kh& ewy fofu;e la[;k 5&4@2000 ¼iz0,oadk0½ fnukad 15 Qjojh] 2001 }kjk izdkf'kr gqvk Fkk rFkk blesa rRi'pkr~ fuEufyf[kr la'kks/ku fd, 
x,%& 

¼i) 1&6@2002&iz0,oadk0 fnukad 22 tuojh] 2004 

¼ii½     5&4@2000&iz0,oadk0¼[k.M&I½ fnukad 11 ebZ] 2004  

¼iii½    5&4@2000&iz0,oadk0¼[k.M&II½ fnukad 17 twu] 2004  

¼iv½    5&4@2000&iz0,oadk0¼[k.M&II½ fnukad 10 ebZ] 2005  

¼v½     5&4@2000&iz0,oadk0¼[k.M&II½ fnukad 26 ebZ] 2006  

¼vi½    5&4@2000&iz0,oadk0¼[k.M&II½ fnukad 09 vDrwcj] 2006  

¼vii)   5&4@2000&iz0,oadk0 fnukad 31 fnlEcj] 2008 

¼viii½    5&4@2005&iz0,oadk0 fnukad 20 ekpZ] 2009  

¼ix½    5&4@2000&iz0,oadk0 fnukad 23 vizSy] 2010  

¼x½    5&4@2000&iz0,oadk0 fnukad 14 tqykbZZ] 2010 

 

 
 



¹Hkkx IIIµ[k.M 4º Hkkjr dk jkti=k % vlk/kj.k 5 

 

 

 

TELECOM REGULATORY AUTHORITY OF INDIA 

NOTIFICATION 

New Delhi, the 8 June, 2016 

THE TELECOM REGULATORY AUTHORITY OF INDIA (OFFICERS AND STAFF APPOINTMENT) 

(ELEVENTH AMENDMENT) REGULATION, 2016. 

(No. 4 of 2016) 

No. 5-1/2014–A&P.–In exercise of the powers conferred by section 36, read with sub-section (1) of section 10, 

of the Telecom Regulatory Authority of India Act, 1997 (24 of 1997), the Telecom Regulatory Authority of India hereby 

makes the following regulation further to amend the Telecom Regulatory Authority of India (Officers and Staff 

Appointment) Regulation, 2001(2 of 2001), namely:— 

1.(1)  This regulation may be called the Telecom Regulatory Authority of India  (Officers and Staff Appointment) 

(Eleventh Amendment) Regulation, 2016. 

(2)   It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette. 

2.    In regulation 3 of the Telecom Regulatory Authority of India (Officers and Staff Appointment) Regulation, 2001 

(hereinafter referred to as the principal regulation), in sub-regulation (iii), in the Table A. Officers’ Cadre, 

under column “Grade/post”, after the entry “Technical Officer”, the entry “Technical Officer (Engineering)” 

shall be inserted.   

3.    In regulation 5 of the principal regulation,--- 

(a)   in sub-regulation (i), in the Table,---  

(i)   against the post of Jt. Advisor, in the column “Mode of recruitment”, for the entry “Deputation/Absorption/ Direct 

Recruitment”, the entry “Promotion/Deputation/ Absorption/Direct Recruitment” shall be substituted;   

(ii) after the entry “Technical Officer”, under column “Name of the Post”, the entry “Technical Officer (Engineering)” 

shall be inserted and against the post “Technical Officer (Engineering)” so inserted,--- 

(A) under column “Mode of recruitment”, the entry “Deputation/Absorption/Direct Recruitment”; and  

(B) under column “Qualification/Experience”, the entry “As in Schedule I”---  

       shall be inserted; 

(b)  after sub-regulation (iii), the following Explanation shall be inserted, namely:- 

“Explanation: For removal of doubts, it is clarified that on appointment on selection to the post of Secretary, Principal 

Advisor, Advisor and Joint Advisor, the service rendered in TRAI by the officers after inclusion in the cadre of TRAI 

shall be counted for grant of retiral benefits and the age limit specified for selection by direct recruitment and 

deputation shall not apply to the officers of TRAI cadre on their selection to the said posts.” 

4.   In regulation 10A of the principal regulation, for sub regulation (1), the following sub-regulation shall be 

substituted, namely :- 

“(1) The Appointing Authority may, from time to time, by appropriate order, appoint any person in the officer cadre on 

permanent absorption basis: 

 Provided that no person shall be appointed on permanent absorption basis unless such person has,--- 

(a) given in writing his option to get permanently absorbed in the Authority, on being  

      called upon to do so by the Authority; and  

(b) completed one year on deputation in the Authority: 

       Provided further that nothing contained in clause (b) of the first proviso shall apply to the appointment upto the 

grade of Senior Research Officer.” 

5.    In regulation 14 of the principal regulation, in sub-regulation (iii), --- 

(a) the words “On the commencement of this Regulation” shall be omitted; 

(b) in the Table B. Staff Cadre, under column “Grade/post”, for the entry “Driver (Grade I) Driver (Grade II)”, the 

entry “Driver (Special Grade) Driver (Grade I) Driver (Grade II) Driver (Ordinary Grade)” shall be substituted;   

6.    In regulation 16 of the principal regulation, --- 

(a)   in sub-regulation (i), in the Table,  after the entry “Lower Division Clerk”, under column “Name of the Post”, the 



6       THE   GAZETTE   OF  INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY              [PART III—SEC. 4] 

 

 

entry “Driver (Special Grade)” shall be inserted and against the post “Driver (Special Grade)” so inserted,---  

(i) under column “Mode of recruitment”, the entry “Promotion”; and 

(ii) under column “Qualification/Experience”, the entry “As in Schedule II”--- 

shall be inserted; 

(b) against the post of Driver (Grade I), in the column “Mode of recruitment”, for the entry 

“Promotion/Deputation/Absorption”, the entry “Promotion” shall be substituted;   

(c) against the post of Driver (Grade II), in the column “Mode of recruitment”, for the entry 

“Promotion/Deputation/Absorption/Direct Recruitment”, the entry “Promotion” shall be substituted;   

(d)  after the entry “Driver (Grade II)”, under column “Name of the Post”, the entry “Driver (Ordinary Grade)” shall be 

inserted and against the post “Driver (Ordinary Grade)” so inserted,--- 

(i) under column “Mode of recruitment”, the entry “Promotion/Deputation/Absorption/ Direct Recruitment”; and  

(ii) under column “Qualification/Experience”, the entry “As in Schedule II”--- 

shall be inserted. 

7.    In regulation 21A of the principal regulation, for sub-regulation (1), the following sub-regulation shall be 

substituted, namely :- 

“(1) The Appointing Authority may, from time to time, by appropriate order, appoint any person in the staff cadre on 

permanent absorption basis: 

Provided that no person shall be appointed on permanent absorption basis unless such person has, on being called 

upon by the Authority for permanent absorption, given in writing his option to get permanently absorbed in the 

Authority.” 

8.   In Schedule I to the principal regulation,--- 

(a) against the post of Principal Advisor, under the heading “Qualification and experience for deputation”,  

(i) in entry (ii), for the words “three years of regular service”, the words “four years of regular service” shall be 

substituted; 

(ii) in entry (iii), for the words “three years of regular service”, the words “four years of regular service” shall be 

substituted; 

(b) against the post of Joint Advisor,---  

(i) under the column “Mode of Recruitment”, for the entry “Deputation/Absorption/ Direct Recruitment”,  the following 

entry shall be substituted, namely:- 

   “(i)   Fifty percent of posts, by promotion failing which by deputation. 

    (ii)   Fifty percent of posts by deputation/absorption/direct recruitment.” 

 (ii)   under the column  “Length of service for promotion”, for the entry “Promotion from amongst officers with (i)     

 4 years of regular service in a grade immediately below”, 

the entry “Promotion from amongst the officers with five years of regular service in a grade immediately below 

possessing the requisite educational and technical qualifications” shall be substituted; 

(iii)    under the column “Qualification and experience for deputation”, 

(A)  in the entry (ii), for the words “four years of regular service”, the words “five years of regular service” shall be 

substituted; 

(B)  in the entry (iii), for the words “four years of regular service”, the words “five years of regular service” shall be 

substituted; 

(c) after the entry “Technical Officer”, under column “Name of Post”, the entry “Technical Officer (Engineering)” shall 

be inserted and against the post “Technical Officer (Engineering)” so inserted, --- 

(i) under column “Mode of recruitment”, the entry “Deputation/Absorption/Direct Recruitment”;    

(ii) under column “Qualification & experience for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Engineering degree in Electronics/ 

Telecommunication/ Information Technology/ Computer Science from a recognized University/ Institutions, with 

three years experience in the relevant field.”; 

(iii)  under column “Length of service for promotion”, the entry “Not Applicable”;  

(iv)  under column “Qualification and experience for deputation”, the entry “Officers of the Central Government, 

Public Sector Undertakings and Statutory and Autonomous Bodies with Engineering degree in Electronics/ 

Telecommunication/ Information Technology/ Computer Science from a recognized University/ Institutions,  (i) 

holding equivalent post or (ii) with three years of regular service in  grade of Section Officer or equivalent. The 

officer must possess the working knowledge of computer and experience in the relevant field.”; and    



¹Hkkx IIIµ[k.M 4º Hkkjr dk jkti=k % vlk/kj.k 7 

 

 

(v) under column “Age for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not exceeding thirty years”--- 

shall be inserted;  

(d) after the Note 6 occurring at the end, the following shall be inserted, namely:-   

“Note 7. - The exemption from the rule of immediate absorption is not required for appointment on deputation basis for 

the posts of Assistant, Section Officer, Senior Research Officer, Deputy Advisor, Joint Advisor, Advisor, Principal 

Advisor and Secretary.”  

9.   In Schedule II to the principal regulation,--- 

(a) against the post of Assistant, under the column “Length of service for promotion”, for the entry “Promotion from 

amongst the officials with ten years of regular service in the LDC grade with working knowledge of computer.”, the 

entry “Promotion from amongst the officials having working knowledge of computer with (i)  ten years of regular 

service in the grade of Lower Division Clerk or  (ii) ten years of regular service in the grade of Photo Copy Machine 

Operator  with Matric or equivalent qualification from a recognised board or institution and successfully qualifying 

examination held by TRAI.” shall be substituted; 

(b) against the post of Lower Division Clerk, under the column “Length of service for promotion”,---  

(i)  in entry (ii), after the words “a typing speed of 30 w.p.m. in English/Hindi”, the words “or proficiency in   

  computer operation to be determined through test” shall be inserted; 

(ii)  the word “and”, occurring after the word “Hindi” in entry (ii), shall be deleted; 

(iii) the entry (iii) shall be deleted. 

(c)  after the entry “Lower Division Clerk”, under column “Name of Post”, the entry “Driver (Special Grade)” shall be 

inserted and against the post “Driver (Special Grade)” so inserted,---  

(i) under column “Mode of recruitment”, the entry “Promotion”;   

(ii) under column “Qualification & experience for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not Applicable”; 

(iii) under column “Length of service for promotion/experience”, the entry “Promotion from amongst the officials 

with three years of regular service in the Driver (Grade I) in pay band-I (Rs. 5200-20200) with Grade Pay of 

Rs. 2800.”; 

(iv) under column “Qualification & experience for transfer on deputation”, the entry “Not Applicable”; and 

(v) under column “Age for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not Applicable”--- 

shall be inserted; 

(d) against the post of Driver (Grade I),--  

(i) under column “Mode of Recruitment”, for the entry “Promotion/Deputation/Absorption/Direct Recruitment”, the 

entry “Promotion”;   

(ii) under column “Qualification & experience for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not Applicable”; 

(iii)  under column “Length of service for promotion/experience” the entry “Promotion from amongst the officials 

with six years of regular service in the Driver (Grade II) in pay band-I (Rs. 5200-20200) with Grade Pay of Rs. 

2400 or with combined service of fifteen years in Driver Grade II and Driver (Ordinary Grade) and having passed 

the trade test specified by the Government.”;  

(iv) under column “Qualification and experience for transfer on deputation”, the entry “Not Applicable”; and  

(v) under column “Age for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not Applicable”,  

shall be substituted; 

(e) against the post of Driver (Grade II),---  

(i) under column “Mode of Recruitment”, for the entry “Promotion/Deputation/ Absorption/Direct Recruitment”, 

the entry “Promotion”;   

(ii) under column “Qualification & experience for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not Applicable”;  

(iii)  under column “Length of service for promotion/experience” the entry “Promotion from amongst the officials 

with nine years of regular service in the Driver (Ordinary Grade) in the pay band-I (Rs. 5200-20200) with 

Grade pay of Rs. 1900.”; 

(iv)  under column “Qualification and experience for transfer on deputation”, the entry “Not Applicable”; and 

(v) under column “Age for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not Applicable”,  

shall be substituted; 

(f)  after the entry “Driver (Grade II)”, under column “Name of Post”, the entry “Driver (Ordinary Grade)” shall be 

inserted and against the post “Driver (Ordinary Grade)” so inserted,--- 

(i) under column “Mode of Recruitment”,  the entry “Promotion/Deputation/ Absorption/Direct Recruitment”;    

(ii) under column “Qualification & experience for Direct Recruit”, the entry “(i) 8th pass, (ii) possessing a valid 



8       THE   GAZETTE   OF  INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY              [PART III—SEC. 4] 

 

 

driving licence for motor cars, (iii) knowledge of motor mechanism (should be able to remove minor defects in 

vehicles) and (iv) experience of  driving of motor cars for three years”;   

(iii) under column “Length of service for promotion/experience”, the entry “Attendant who possesses the following– 

(i) pass in 8th Standard, (ii) possessing a valid driving licence for motor cars, (iii) knowledge of motor 

mechanism (should be able to remove minor defects in vehicles) and (iv) experience of driving of motor cars for 

three  years”;   

(iv)  under column  “Qualification and experience for transfer on deputation”, the entry “Officials of the Central 

Government, Public Sector Undertakings and Statutory and Autonomous Bodies holding equivalent post or 

Attendant/ Group D employee who possesses the following–  

(i) pass in 8th Standard, (ii) possessing a valid driving licence for motor cars, (iii)   knowledge of motor mechanism 

(should be able to remove minor defects in  vehicles)  and (iv) experience of driving of motor cars for three 

years.”; and 

(v) under column “Age for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not exceeding forty years”, 

shall be inserted. 

10.   In Schedule III to the principal regulation, under column “Name of the Post”,--- 

(a)   for the entry “Technical Officer”, the entry “Technical Officer & Technical Officer (Engineering)” shall be 

inserted;  

(b)  for the entry “Driver (Grade I) Driver (Grade II)”, the entry “Driver (Special Grade) Driver (Grade I) Driver (Grade 

II) Driver (Ordinary Grade)” shall be substituted. 

C. P. S.  BAKSHI, Advisor (Admin)  

[ADVT.-III/4/Exty./128/16] 

Note.--- The principal regulations were published vide no.5-4/2000 (A&L) dated 15th February 2001 and amended vide   

(i) 1-6/2002-A&L dated 22nd January, 2004  

(ii) 5-4/2000-A&L (Vol.I) dated 11th May, 2004  

(iii) 5-4/2000-A&L (Vol.II) dated 17th June, 2004  

(iv) 5-4/2000-A&P (Vol.II) dated 10th May, 2005  

(v) 5-4/2000-A&P (Vol.II) dated 26th May, 2006  

(vi) 5-4/2000-A&P (Vol.II) dated 9th October, 2006  

(vii) 5-4/2000-A&P dated 31st December, 2008  

(viii) 5-4/2005-A&P dated 20th March, 2009 

(ix) 5-4/2000-A&P dated 23rd April, 2010 

(x) 5-4/2000-A&P dated 14th July, 2010 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of  India  Press, Ring  Road,  Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064 

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. 


