W= o Slo TA0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

W < A9
CThe Gazette of India

EXTRAORDINARY
9T III—9us 4
PART III—Section 4

TR | YerTiyTa
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

|, 247] 73 feoelt, Fgwfaar, S 9, 2016/ 19, 1938
No. 247] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, JUNE 9, 2016/ JYAISTHA 19, 1938

RGN XEAR fafame gridrevor
RIEGCEI
3 faeell, 8 S, 2016
TR SRR fafame mitesr (el sk sHeial ot fyfa) R, 2016
(2016 T 04)

. 5-1/2014-9. Ud HI—IRAN IR A Rmd witaRor oM, 1997 (1997 &1 24) @1 gRT 10 &I IU—GRT (1) T
gRT 36 @ SU-URT (1) R USd WAl & WM &xd U, R ReaR fafams midew, wRde eer fafams
yTrROT(ERAIRAT 3R BHaTal & Fgfda) fafm, 2001 (2001 @1 2) # 3R WA a=A & v TaggRT Frfeiad fafrm aamr
g, arf —

1. (1) =9 R & YR TEIR
ST |

() % fafm, sH@ AR ToUF H YabreH ol [ | o1 g |

2. TR REAR faframe oridrexer (sffreRal den swemRal @ Fyfda) fafem, 2001 (W g9@ geamq qa i ser smem)
o foftam 3 & Su-fafgw (iii) ¥ aifera-a § I8 /5" Ffem & dd MGG & Haw & Ted daa afeR ufifte &
eI qAd] ARHRT QEial)” B sfavenfuad faar s

fafrme wiReRvIERERE! don wHeRal o ffd) (TReal dewm) faftam, 2016 @@

@) ol @1 W dlaw H FYEd FARGR F U B G UG /emer /W ol wfife 3§ wm W
"It / STl / amiver /A ol @ wfewenfi R smo,

(i) "gg @1 AW’ FfeW T qed "dHNl IGR ylife & uvE “dEe AR (@Eite)’ yfafte @1 sfawenfia fhar
SITQT oI U9 SfRefiT “qdiia Afar) @fifal)” ue & awe, ..

(@) "l &1 T Biem B dgd IR /mien /d i, wfafte; sik

(@) "arer / Ha” Bl & ded a1 & JAGER” ufdfe S sfaeni fear S,

(@) Su-—fafam (iii) @ weamq, 1= G B fdxefd febar STe, T —

"TAEGRY © IE R PR D (oY, UE W AT W € b |ea, TN AARHR, GARPR 3R GYH AARPR & U W 9T
?q Mo 89 R feRal gR1 IR ReaR Rfame wiieR @ gt § affod 6T 9 @ eE YR REaR

2943 GI/2016 H




2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

fafrare witeRT # UM @1 T WA Bl HAGRT oM UG dR @ (oY AR fHAr Sem den Sad ual WA R iR
it & "em 9 30 A o i oy @ aRd Rear f[fame witerer daif & sifteRal w ar 78 e |

4. 7 fafrem & fafem 109 # Su—ffrm (1) & wH w, 791 Su-fafam @1 ufrenfid f&ar smem, e —

(1) Frfad WReR), T-9wa R, SUYAd ey & ArAd ¥ IR 3o MR W AReRal & datt 9 fof afdd @ fyfaa
TR THA 2

e (6l ol fda Bl Y el SR Fged T8l fbar e, o e 6 U gt

(@) TERET §RT VAT B & forg e S IR WIRIGReT ¥ Rl ®U & amferd 89 @ forg forlRaa # oo fadew =1 fear 21 aiR

(@) wftrRoT 4 U ¥ @1 giafgfea srafy gof 7 &

T M 5 T WE @ WU (@) ¥ sfafde B W I IS s e I % @ e W ar T e

5. a1 fafrm & fafem 14, & Su-fafvem (i), # ...

(®) "z faffrm & N 8 W A=t B A fpar e,
(@) Tferdr-g & "IS/U5" Blem & ded dHAN Gat 7 gRREs-I), srREs-I)’ wife & wF W gRRRET 39),
R (Te-]) R @e-1I), SRa (MR ¥€)” & yferenfid fa=m S

6. o1 fafrm & faffrr 16, # ...

(@) Su-fafvam (i) ® rferdr ® “Ug & AW Bem & ded R Al fofid wfifte & uearq CgR(fER I6)” @1 sfdenfid
foar Sem e gy I8)” ug @ el e sfaenfud fhar S,

() "eft &1 T Blem & ded, W gfafte, qen
(i1) “araar /aga” wfafte & qed “ogEl-11 & R’ ufife 31 siqvenfia fdar s,

(@) "wdl B W Biew H gRaR @e-I) 17 & wHE W/ uiinga /sme . glafe & M W gef e
yfcRenfUd o S,

(M) w1 R DM H greR (Te-11) ug & FH U /Ui /e /e il gfafe & M ) U
gfafte a1 gfrenfia foan sme;

@ "9 & TH' oW & ded SRR [@e-1) e & uwEr SRR (ERY )’ @ siasenfud fear o qen
"STER (MR Ye)” Ug & |uel {7 senfia fhar Smg,...

(i) "welt &1 Rrr” Biew & ded U/ IR /amies /A e wfafe; ek
(i) “arEar /rga” wfafte & qed “orgEl-11 & R’ ufifte 31 siqvenfia fdar e,

7. 0 ffem & fafem 219 4, Su-fafem(1) & =R ® = Su-—fafem o1 gfoeenfia fsan smoe, Ama—

“(1) Frgfea wier), TH-TTa R, STEd ARy & AeH W Rl e JMR W HHaIal @ |aw 9 fedd A afdd o
e @R T &

g fob foodll o e @l 2ol oo SR W FYged e fbar e, W de 6 el afed |, el smed e
TR gRT g8 WM W, fofea # widewer # <erdt w9 9 smiferd g &1 fiwen 7 fear &y

8. a1 faffrm &t orRgd-1 4, ..

(@) "vfafgfed 3q draar qen arpa” Ve & ded WM GeRaR & UG & e,
(

1) wfafe (i) ¥ 0 quf @) Frafa S vk & WM W CaR Tt o A e weal o gfoenfid fear s
(i) vfafe (i) ® "= aut @ fafid da vel & @M W “gR 9 o Fafia dar @ o giovenfyd fam ST

(@) WY FARIR S US b G, ...

(i) "Wl BT WIST Bl & qed UG /e /Al war wfife @ o w e ufdfe @1 gforenfua fem S,
T~

“(i) 9T & HEEH W UE ORI UGl I RT QA AT A B W UST Bl URigId @ AegH § R S |
ii) 79T g uel el Ui /o /e i @ A R S |

’._D

(i) "9 2 Ha1 B ARy’ Biem & d'd () B S & fory TR fAr M R, S UF U AW @ US W AR 9§ 3
AT Il FR drel SRHINAT H ¥ UG @ AR Ui & W )M ue 3 fofy 79 R I 8, S9N U IS
7g R ufg aut @t frafid dar gf axe arel sfeR, e o sriferd el den daie A 2, 99 afteRal # &
& AeIH W ¥l I UfRerfid far S,

St




[T IT-ETS 4] A <l TS« SHEROT 3

iii) “fafgfad 2 aradr ok ava” HidH & g,

(@) fdfle (ii) ¥ "R a9 @ FAFHT Far IR & WE R "UiE q6 o) Ffa dar el o gforenfud fear s
(@) vfofe (iii) # "ar auf @ Frfid Ja w€l @ WE W) " au o afd dar o girenfid fGar s

(M "Ig @ AW DM B ded TS JRER e & gvEr deeel e (@fife)” ufafe @ sfaenfia fhar
SITQT I V¥ SfRefid ddiia Afar) @faifal)’ ue & wwe, .

(i) "cft 1 e Biem & ded “HRgfId /e /A ol ufafie;

(i) "t el g Aar dR STMa” BieW @ ded Selagivad / REAR /qE Uenfa / drge] e fdvg # 6 A
T faeafdener /wee @ st § S () @ @ 6 d &3 # A9 9§ @ orgva;

(iii) "I B WaT @ Ay BieW & dEd o TE ufafe;

(iv) "Wl &g Araar 3R oWd” BicM & d8d P WROR, AAGd &7 @ Seml adl difde dR R el @
AR, o il wmrar ora favafdener /AR 9 Selagied / AR /o Wenfia / dveger g v # sifrifa
fowy & IUTfer oTe B Srerar (i) SFFWIT SRBR) Sierar FHGE U H <l auf @ AT e qf R go @ | PR B YR
BT PRSI TAT G &5 H A9 3@ BT AMRY”; SR

(v) "< it 3 oY BieM & ded A a¥ ¥ e T8 81 ufifie @1 ofqwenfia far e

(&) 3fd # a1 ATt fowvr 6 & TwErq, A RfdRenfud fosar wem, A —

"Ry 7 —HES, AT ARHR, IS FTHIH IRFR, IT—HATHR, T TARIR, FARHR, Y FAGHR iR A @
78 W yfafgfad SR W FYfa &g QXA e fy 9 & fRm 9 e e T g 1

9. a1 fafrm o org-1I1 ¥ ..

(@) "W B WET B AT Bl b ded GEAD D UG & GHE HRICY b HRIANG F & A FR Al fofis & U A
T a9 @1 FRfG d61 QO @R 9o FHaIRAl & 7 9 U @ AR 9 gl & W R OSRER & ribme 9 G
el HHAINAT & 7 F G & AeEH 9 o (i) s/ Ao fofis @ I A <9 aut @ fFRfia @6 gof aR ge @ s (i)
BTG HIH 3ffRex & U § < a81 @l Ifid qa1 & A1y 7rdl U 91 JaT SR W AfSH Sfrar qHeel ARgar qor
TRAT AR RS TR gRT S tRie Shaldgdd Sl & &1 ¥l & Ufaeenfud feam S,

(@) "l 2 HaT @ A’ Fiem & dgd ok Soft fafle & U & wHe, .

() wlfe (i) % “sfel /R # 30 w Ufd fdc @1 <@ur I oIl & UTAq eHrdT IR YATe H Udor @ R
TRIET & eI | A ST wrest b wfoeenfid o S,

(i) gffle (id) #, “R=1" o & UTENq M dTel I “TAT’ BT A fHar S
(i) wfafe (iii) @1 o famm S

(M "5 B AW Blem & ded IR Ao fofte” ufife & v, g I8) @1 sfdwenfid fhar Smom qen v
iawnfd SRRy I8)” & ug & wH, .

(i) "weft &1 T dlem & ded “wwf, gl

(i1) el weff ¥ AT SR STIWA” BieW @ dEd AR T fafte;

(iii) "I S WA B @ /3 Bl b ded’ 2800 BUY Ue—U & AN U-ds—I (5200-20200 ¥UY) H g (Is-1) A
T ad @ Frafrd T qf a) ge eHaiial & W 9 Ul @ Jeam 9 gt

(iv) “IfFRfT & MR W IFaaT SR 3FIHa” HieW & ded “ar] el yafie; iR

(v) "<+t B oMY Piem & ded AN Tl ufdfe...

I ST B ST

(@) sER (-1) & uT & que, ..

(i) "l @1 T BieM & Ted U /IR / 3mied /el Wil fife & wm w g it

(1) el el 2 A SR Ve BieW & dgd” AT Tel” vl

(iii) "UfT B AT B FAf /T PiM b qed 2400 IUT YU & WY U—de—I (520020200 BUY) H glER (Ue-II) H
BE qY o) (AT e siEr grea” Y11 I SIgaR (AR Ue) H el USE Y 3l Hal QO IR g HHANI, (e TR gRI
faffde ¢e cwe S<inf fan &1, &1 U=Ifd & Arew 9 vfafie;

(iv) "wfafgfaa 2q I iR e S & ded “ar] Tei” ufdfie; siR
(v) el i Rq Ry’ Pl & ded o T wlafe, @1 s fbar W,




4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

(@) sRRE-II) & U5 & 99, ..
(i) "welt &1 Ry Bl & Ted U/ R /amie /W ol gfife & e w I gfafe;
(1) el el 2 A SR Ve BieW & dgd” AT Tel” ufafte;

(iii) "I ¥ WET @A@Y /AT DI B ded 1900 TUY F—U @ FT U—d8—T (5200-20200 TIV) H SIEAR(ARIR Ie)
# A af 31 Fafd S Of @) g HHeRal @ W W gl @ e 9 ufafe;

(iv) "fafRgfaa 2 aradn ofR e i @ ded “an] Tl ufife; sik

(v) " Wl &g oY Pl & ded AN Tel ufdfe, @1 afq-wenfia far S,

@ "Ig @1 AW’ Blem & ded gREES-I)’ ufe & uvEn CSREREMRT )’ B i fhar smem qur
AT "SRR IS)” & IS & TH,...

(i) et BT b1 Bl & e WIS /Gl / e /e el gfafe;

(i) "¥eN Wil 3 IFEAT SR WS BiaW & ded d(i) SMedl Hem S, (i) WeX PR AN I A SR AT B
AR, (111)Fha e UTTell BT FF(AET | BIS-AIC! WAl & g $e1 § |eM @) 3R (iv) O a9 Aiex SR I @ T
2, yfafe

(iii) W%@@maﬁm/m Pl & dgd (1) amodi bem ST, (i) AR R dA B 9 ST oAged B
ﬂT%U(111)%?WWW@H(W#@E‘#Hﬁé’r@ﬁuﬁﬁaﬁaﬂ#ﬁﬂwﬁ)sﬁ?ﬁv)ﬁﬂaﬁiwzﬁﬂﬂaﬁwm
2, yfafe

(iv) uﬁﬁqﬁﬁ IR TR IR 2 AT IR M DM @ Ted Ds IR, Add &7 & SeHi a |ifae iR
ard feml & wHar), =R 96 U8 9RO {61 81 Jrdl W 9 & $an), o (9 amgar g

“(i) amedt wenr I, (ii) AIeR BR AW BT 9 P @A BFT AMRY, (iii) Aew—dres YTell & FH(@ET § BIC-Ac!
Al $ X F ¥ W 7)) AR (iv) T a9 Hiex FR T BT A 8, iR

(v) " Wl & Ay Bier & ded Aol 9y | e 7 B gafe, HI siqRerfue far S,

10. At fafEm @1 "1 ¥, "Us &1 99" Ble¥ & e, ...

(@) TP FRPR” Yfifte B OF W THND! ARBRY T TH1a BN (@fife))” ufafte o1 sfdzenfia fear smom;

)
@) "SRWEs-1)" AR gERES-I)’ e & WM | SRR (@9 U), sRREs-I), sEREST) T SRaERERRT
Ie)” ufafe a1 wferenfya far Sem|

1. 0. o, 9N, FARHR (T
[T, -111/4/31%1./128/16]
ﬁ:’mﬁ—qaﬁﬁmﬂws 4,/2000 (F0VGHI0) fTid 15 HRER, 2001 FRT VIR T3 o AT §HH TULANq FriforRad FeMme g

M) 1—6 / 2002—H0TAHI0 {3 22 TaR], 2004

(i) 5—4 / 2000-Y0vddI0(@ve—1) faid 11 7, 2004

(iii) 5—4 / 2000~ 90Vge10(TUe—I1) fAld 17 T, 2004
(iv) 5—4 / 2000—J0Vdd10(@US—1II) faid 10 s, 2005
v) 5—4 / 2000~50Td10(@ve—11) f&AId 26 S, 2006

(vi) 5—4 / 2000—~Y0UdeH10(TUe—I1) I 09 TaIeR, 2006

(vii) 5—4 /2000-50Vd®10 fd 31 fod=R, 2008

(viii) 5—4 /2005-90VdHI0 feHTH 20 A, 2009
(ix) 5—4 /2000—~90TdHI0 ol 23 3MidT, 2010

x) 5—4 / 2000—-40Ta10 {3 14 JelTg, 2010




[T IT-ETS 4] A <l TS« SHEROT 5

TELECOM REGULATORY AUTHORITY OF INDIA
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 8 June, 2016

THE TELECOM REGULATORY AUTHORITY OF INDIA (OFFICERS AND STAFF APPOINTMENT)
(ELEVENTH AMENDMENT) REGULATION, 2016.

(No. 4 of 2016)

No. 5-1/2014—-A &P .—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 36, read with sub-section (1) of section 10,
of the Telecom Regulatory Authority of India Act, 1997 (24 of 1997), the Telecom Regulatory Authority of India hereby
makes the following regulation further to amend the Telecom Regulatory Authority of India (Officers and Staff
Appointment) Regulation, 2001(2 of 2001), namely:—

1.(1) This regulation may be called the Telecom Regulatory Authority of India (Officers and Staff Appointment)
(Eleventh Amendment) Regulation, 2016.

(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In regulation 3 of the Telecom Regulatory Authority of India (Officers and Staff Appointment) Regulation, 2001
(hereinafter referred to as the principal regulation), in sub-regulation (iii), in the Table A. Officers’ Cadre,
under column “Grade/post”, after the entry “Technical Officer”, the entry “Technical Officer (Engineering)”
shall be inserted.

3. Inregulation 5 of the principal regulation,---

(a) in sub-regulation (i), in the Table,---

(i) against the post of Jt. Advisor, in the column “Mode of recruitment”, for the entry “Deputation/Absorption/ Direct
Recruitment”, the entry “Promotion/Deputation/ Absorption/Direct Recruitment” shall be substituted;

(ii) after the entry “Technical Officer”, under column “Name of the Post”, the entry “Technical Officer (Engineering)”
shall be inserted and against the post “Technical Officer (Engineering)” so inserted,---

(A) under column “Mode of recruitment”, the entry “Deputation/Absorption/Direct Recruitment”; and
(B) under column “Qualification/Experience”, the entry “As in Schedule I”’---
shall be inserted;

(b) after sub-regulation (iii), the following Explanation shall be inserted, namely:-

“Explanation: For removal of doubts, it is clarified that on appointment on selection to the post of Secretary, Principal
Advisor, Advisor and Joint Advisor, the service rendered in TRAI by the officers after inclusion in the cadre of TRAI
shall be counted for grant of retiral benefits and the age limit specified for selection by direct recruitment and
deputation shall not apply to the officers of TRAI cadre on their selection to the said posts.”

4. Inregulation 10A of the principal regulation, for sub regulation (1), the following sub-regulation shall be
substituted, namely :-

“(1) The Appointing Authority may, from time to time, by appropriate order, appoint any person in the officer cadre on
permanent absorption basis:

Provided that no person shall be appointed on permanent absorption basis unless such person has,---

(a) given in writing his option to get permanently absorbed in the Authority, on being
called upon to do so by the Authority; and

(b) completed one year on deputation in the Authority:

Provided further that nothing contained in clause (b) of the first proviso shall apply to the appointment upto the
grade of Senior Research Officer.”

5. Inregulation 14 of the principal regulation, in sub-regulation (iii), ---

(a) the words “On the commencement of this Regulation” shall be omitted;

(b) in the Table B. Staff Cadre, under column “Grade/post”, for the entry “Driver (Grade I) Driver (Grade II)”, the
entry “Driver (Special Grade) Driver (Grade I) Driver (Grade II) Driver (Ordinary Grade)” shall be substituted;

6. Inregulation 16 of the principal regulation, ---

(a) in sub-regulation (i), in the Table, after the entry “Lower Division Clerk”, under column “Name of the Post”, the




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

entry “Driver (Special Grade)” shall be inserted and against the post “Driver (Special Grade)” so inserted,---

(1) under column “Mode of recruitment”, the entry “Promotion”; and
(ii))  under column “Qualification/Experience”, the entry “As in Schedule IT"---
shall be inserted;

(b) against the post of Driver (Grade I), in the column “Mode of recruitment”, for the entry
“Promotion/Deputation/Absorption”, the entry “Promotion” shall be substituted;

(c) against the post of Driver (Grade II), in the column “Mode of recruitment”, for the entry
“Promotion/Deputation/Absorption/Direct Recruitment”, the entry “Promotion” shall be substituted;

(d) after the entry “Driver (Grade II)”, under column “Name of the Post”, the entry “Driver (Ordinary Grade)” shall be
inserted and against the post “Driver (Ordinary Grade)” so inserted,---

@) under column “Mode of recruitment”, the entry “Promotion/Deputation/Absorption/ Direct Recruitment”; and
(ii))  under column “Qualification/Experience”, the entry “As in Schedule IT"---
shall be inserted.

7. In regulation 21A of the principal regulation, for sub-regulation (1), the following sub-regulation shall be
substituted, namely :-

“(1) The Appointing Authority may, from time to time, by appropriate order, appoint any person in the staff cadre on
permanent absorption basis:

Provided that no person shall be appointed on permanent absorption basis unless such person has, on being called
upon by the Authority for permanent absorption, given in writing his option to get permanently absorbed in the
Authority.”

8. 1In Schedule I to the principal regulation,---

(a) against the post of Principal Advisor, under the heading “Qualification and experience for deputation”,

(i) in entry (ii), for the words “three years of regular service”, the words “four years of regular service” shall be
substituted;

(il) in entry (iii), for the words “three years of regular service”, the words “four years of regular service” shall be
substituted;

(b) against the post of Joint Advisor,---

(i) under the column “Mode of Recruitment”, for the entry “Deputation/Absorption/ Direct Recruitment”, the following
entry shall be substituted, namely:-

“(i) Fifty percent of posts, by promotion failing which by deputation.
(ii) Fifty percent of posts by deputation/absorption/direct recruitment.”

(i) under the column “Length of service for promotion”, for the entry “Promotion from amongst officers with (i)
4 years of regular service in a grade immediately below”,

the entry “Promotion from amongst the officers with five years of regular service in a grade immediately below
possessing the requisite educational and technical qualifications” shall be substituted;

(iii)) under the column “Qualification and experience for deputation”,

(A) in the entry (ii), for the words “four years of regular service”, the words “five years of regular service” shall be
substituted;

(B) in the entry (iii), for the words “four years of regular service”, the words “five years of regular service” shall be
substituted;

(c) after the entry “Technical Officer”, under column “Name of Post”, the entry “Technical Officer (Engineering)” shall
be inserted and against the post “Technical Officer (Engineering)” so inserted, ---

(i)  under column “Mode of recruitment”, the entry “Deputation/Absorption/Direct Recruitment”;

(i) under column “Qualification & experience for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Engineering degree in Electronics/
Telecommunication/ Information Technology/ Computer Science from a recognized University/ Institutions, with
three years experience in the relevant field.”;

(iii))  under column “Length of service for promotion”, the entry “Not Applicable”;

(iv) under column “Qualification and experience for deputation”, the entry “Officers of the Central Government,
Public Sector Undertakings and Statutory and Autonomous Bodies with Engineering degree in Electronics/
Telecommunication/ Information Technology/ Computer Science from a recognized University/ Institutions, (i)
holding equivalent post or (ii) with three years of regular service in grade of Section Officer or equivalent. The
officer must possess the working knowledge of computer and experience in the relevant field.”; and




[T IT-ETS 4] A <l TS« SHEROT 7

(v)  under column “Age for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not exceeding thirty years”---
shall be inserted;

(d) after the Note 6 occurring at the end, the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“Note 7. - The exemption from the rule of immediate absorption is not required for appointment on deputation basis for
the posts of Assistant, Section Officer, Senior Research Officer, Deputy Advisor, Joint Advisor, Advisor, Principal
Adpvisor and Secretary.”

9. In Schedule II to the principal regulation,---

(a) against the post of Assistant, under the column “Length of service for promotion”, for the entry “Promotion from
amongst the officials with ten years of regular service in the LDC grade with working knowledge of computer.”, the
entry “Promotion from amongst the officials having working knowledge of computer with (i) ten years of regular
service in the grade of Lower Division Clerk or (ii) ten years of regular service in the grade of Photo Copy Machine
Operator with Matric or equivalent qualification from a recognised board or institution and successfully qualifying
examination held by TRAIL.” shall be substituted;

(b) against the post of Lower Division Clerk, under the column “Length of service for promotion”,---

(i) in entry (ii), after the words “a typing speed of 30 w.p.m. in English/Hindi”, the words “or proficiency in
computer operation to be determined through test” shall be inserted;

(i1) the word “and”, occurring after the word “Hindi” in entry (ii), shall be deleted;
(iii) the entry (iii) shall be deleted.

(c) after the entry “Lower Division Clerk”, under column “Name of Post”, the entry “Driver (Special Grade)” shall be
inserted and against the post “Driver (Special Grade)” so inserted,---

(1) under column “Mode of recruitment”, the entry “Promotion”;

(i1) under column “Qualification & experience for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not Applicable”;

(iii) under column “Length of service for promotion/experience”, the entry “Promotion from amongst the officials
with three years of regular service in the Driver (Grade I) in pay band-I (Rs. 5200-20200) with Grade Pay of
Rs. 2800.7;

@iv) under column “Qualification & experience for transfer on deputation”, the entry “Not Applicable”’; and

) under column “Age for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not Applicable”---

shall be inserted;

(d) against the post of Driver (Grade I),--

(i)  under column “Mode of Recruitment”, for the entry “Promotion/Deputation/Absorption/Direct Recruitment”, the
entry “Promotion”;

(i) under column “Qualification & experience for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not Applicable”;

(iii)) under column “Length of service for promotion/experience” the entry “Promotion from amongst the officials
with six years of regular service in the Driver (Grade II) in pay band-I (Rs. 5200-20200) with Grade Pay of Rs.
2400 or with combined service of fifteen years in Driver Grade II and Driver (Ordinary Grade) and having passed
the trade test specified by the Government.”;

(iv) under column “Qualification and experience for transfer on deputation”, the entry “Not Applicable”; and

(v)  under column “Age for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not Applicable”,

shall be substituted;

(e) against the post of Driver (Grade II),---

@) under column “Mode of Recruitment”, for the entry “Promotion/Deputation/ Absorption/Direct Recruitment”,
the entry “Promotion”;

(i1) under column “Qualification & experience for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not Applicable”;

(iii) under column “Length of service for promotion/experience” the entry ‘“Promotion from amongst the officials

with nine years of regular service in the Driver (Ordinary Grade) in the pay band-I (Rs. 5200-20200) with
Grade pay of Rs. 1900.”;

@iv) under column “Qualification and experience for transfer on deputation”, the entry “Not Applicable”; and
) under column “Age for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not Applicable”,
shall be substituted;

(f) after the entry “Driver (Grade II)”, under column “Name of Post”, the entry “Driver (Ordinary Grade)” shall be
inserted and against the post “Driver (Ordinary Grade)” so inserted,---

(i)  under column “Mode of Recruitment”, the entry “Promotion/Deputation/ Absorption/Direct Recruitment”;
(ii)) under column “Qualification & experience for Direct Recruit”’, the entry “(i) 8th pass, (ii) possessing a valid




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

(iii)

@iv)

@

v)

driving licence for motor cars, (iii) knowledge of motor mechanism (should be able to remove minor defects in
vehicles) and (iv) experience of driving of motor cars for three years”;

under column “Length of service for promotion/experience”, the entry “Attendant who possesses the following—
(1) pass in 8th Standard, (ii) possessing a valid driving licence for motor cars, (iii) knowledge of motor
mechanism (should be able to remove minor defects in vehicles) and (iv) experience of driving of motor cars for
three years”;

under column “Qualification and experience for transfer on deputation”, the entry “Officials of the Central
Government, Public Sector Undertakings and Statutory and Autonomous Bodies holding equivalent post or
Attendant/ Group D employee who possesses the following—

pass in 8th Standard, (ii) possessing a valid driving licence for motor cars, (iii) knowledge of motor mechanism
(should be able to remove minor defects in vehicles) and (iv) experience of driving of motor cars for three
years.”; and

under column “Age for Direct Recruit”, the entry “Not exceeding forty years”,

shall be inserted.

10.

In Schedule III to the principal regulation, under column “Name of the Post”,---

()

for the entry “Technical Officer”, the entry “Technical Officer & Technical Officer (Engineering)” shall be
inserted;

(b) for the entry “Driver (Grade I) Driver (Grade II)”, the entry “Driver (Special Grade) Driver (Grade I) Driver (Grade

II) Driver (Ordinary Grade)” shall be substituted.

C. P.S. BAKSHI, Advisor (Admin)
[ADVT.-1II/4/Exty./128/16]

Note.--- The principal regulations were published vide no.5-4/2000 (A&L) dated 15th February 2001 and amended vide

(@)
(i)
(iii)
@iv)
)
(vi)
(vii)
(viii)
(ix)
(x)

1-6/2002-A&L dated 22nd January, 2004
5-4/2000-A&L (Vol.I) dated 11th May, 2004
5-4/2000-A&L (Vol.Il) dated 17th June, 2004
5-4/2000-A&P (Vol.II) dated 10th May, 2005
5-4/2000-A&P (Vol.II) dated 26th May, 2006
5-4/2000-A&P (Vol.II) dated 9th October, 2006
5-4/2000-A &P dated 31st December, 2008
5-4/2005-A &P dated 20th March, 2009
5-4/2000-A&P dated 23rd April, 2010
5-4/2000-A&P dated 14th July, 2010

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.




